Ban dich tom tit tham khao
Quy dinh vé An toan San pham va Po ludng (Stra dbi va Diéu khoan chuyén
tiép) nam 2022
Vin ban s6 1393/2022

RUT KHOI LIEN MINH CHAU AU; BAO VE NGUOI TIEU DUNG;
TUONG THICH DIEN TU; TIET KIEM NANG LUQNG; BAO VE MOI
TRUONG; SUC KHOE VA AN TOAN; VIEN THONG; PON VI CAN NANG
VA DON VI PO LUONG
Ban hanh ngay 21 thang 12 nam 2022
Co hiéu luc twr ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2022
Bo truong Ngoai giao ban hanh cac Quy dinh nay dé thuc hién cac quyén han
duogc trao theo muc 8(1) va diéu 21 caa Phu luc 7 cta Pao luat (Rut khoi) Lién

minh Chau Au nim 2018,

Du thdo cta van kién nay da dugc trinh 1én Quéc hoi theo khoan 1(3) cia Phu
luc 7 ctia Pao luat d6 va duoc phé chuan theo nghi quyét cia mdi Vién.

Trich dan, c6 hiéu luc va pham vi

1.— (1) Quy dinh nay c6 thé duoc goi 1a Quy dinh vé An toan va Po luong San
pham (Piéu khoan stra d6i va Chuyén tiép) nam 2022 va c6 hiéu luc vao ngay
31 thang 12 ndm 2022.

(2) Cac Quy dinh nay mé rong dén Anh, xit Wales va Scotland.

Hét han cac diéu khoan lién quan dén nghia vu duoc dap tng bang cach tuan thu
cac yéu cau theo luat phap Chau Au

2. Trong cac quy dinh tai Phu luc 1, “24 thang” thay thé “4 nam”.

Gia han thoi gian ma sau d6 cac quy dinh ghi nhan tam thoi hét hiéu luyc

3. Trong quy dinh tai Phu luc 2, “36 thang” thay thé “7 nam”.

Hét hiéu lyc quy dinh lién quan dén thong tin nhan biét nguoi nhap khau

4. Trong quy dinh tai Phu luc 3, “24 thang” thay thé “7 nam”.

Stra d6i Quy dinh vé phat thai tiéng 6n trong méi trudng cua thiét bi sir dung
ngoai troi ndm 2001

5. Quy dinh vé phat thai tiéng 6n trong mdi trudng cua thiét bi sir dung ngoai
troi 2001(2) da duoc sira doi. Ban stra doi néu rd rang néu mot san pham chua
dugc dua ra thi truong hoac chua dugc dua vao st dung trude 11 gio dém ngay
31 thang 12 nam 2024 va nguoi ¢o trach nhiém da thuc hién bét ky hanh dong
nao theo quy trinh danh gia su phu hop thi Diéu (5) s& duoc ap dung. Tuy nhién,
Piéu (5) khong ap dung sau khi hét han bat ky chimg chi nao dugc cép theo thi
tuc danh gia su phu hop hoac sau ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2027.

Stra d6i Quy dinh Cung cap May méc (An toan) 2008

6. Quy dinh vé Cung cdp May moc (An toan) 2008(3) da duogc sira d6i dé bao
gdm diéu khoan chuyén tiép trong quy dinh 30 vé viéc roi khoi EU. Ban stra d6i



néu ro rﬁng néu mot san phém chua dugc dua ra thi truong hodc dua vao st
dung trude 11 gio dém ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2024 va nguoi co6 trach nhiém da
thue hién bat ky hanh dong nao theo quy trinh dénh gia sy phu hop theo Diéu 12
ctia Chi thi, diéu (4) s& duoc ap dung. Tuy nhién, diéu (4) khong ap dung sau khi
hét han bat ky chtng chi nao dugc cdp theo thu tuc danh gia su phu hop hoic
sau ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2027.

Stra 61 Quy dinh (EU) 1223/2009

7. Trong Diéu 19 cta Quy dinh (EU) 1223/2009 ctia Nghi vién va Hoi dong
Chéau Au vé san phdm my pham (ghi nhin) tai diéu (1)(ab) cho “hai nim” thay
thé “bay nam”.

Stra d6i Quy dinh vé Thiét ké sinh thai cho cic san pham lién quan dén ning
lugng nam 2010

8. Quy dinh vé Thiét ké sinh thai cho cic san pham lién quan dén ning luong
2010(5) da duoc sira doi dé bao gdm diéu khoan chuyén tiép trong quy dinh 20A
vé viée 101 khoi EU. Ban stra d6i néu rd réng néu mot san phém chua duoc dua
ra thi truong hodc dua vao str dung trudc 11 gid dém ngay 31 thdng 12 nam
2024 va nha san xuat da thuc hién bat ky hanh dong nao theo quy trinh danh gia
su phu hop thi hanh dong d6 s€ c6 hiéu luc nhu thé né da duoc thuc hién theo
thu tuc 4p dung tai Phy luc 1A. Tuy nhién, diéu 4A khong ap dung sau khi hét
han bat ky gidy chting nhan nao duoc cip theo thi tuc hodc sau ngay 31 thang
12 nam 2027.

Stra d6i Quy dinh vé D6 choi (An toan) nim 2011

9. Quy dinh vé D6 choi (An toan) 2011(6) di duoc sira doi dé bao gom diéu
khoan chuyén tiép trong quy dinh 2A vé viéc roi khéi EU. Ban sira doi néu rd
rang néu modt san pham chua duoc dua ra thi trudng trude 11 gid dém ngay 31
thang 12 nim 2024 va nha san xuat di thuc hién bat ky hanh dong nao theo quy
trinh danh gid sy phu hop thi hanh dong dé c6 hiéu lyc nhu thé n6 duge thuc
hién theo quy dinh 13. Tuy nhién, diéu (6) khong ap dung sau khi hét han bat ky
chtng chi nao dugc cap theo thi tuc danh gia sy phu hop hodc sau ngay 31
thang 12 nam 2027.

Stra d6i Quy dinh vé Thude n6 2014

10. Quy dinh vé chat nd 2014(7) da duoc stra d6i dé bao gdm diéu khoan chuyén
tiép trong quy dinh 82A lién quan dén viéc roi khoéi EU. Ban stra d6i néu 1o rang
néu mot san pham chua dugc dua ra thi truong trude 11 gid dém ngay 31 thang
12 nam 2024 va nha san xuét da thuc hién bat ky hanh dong nao theo quy trinh
danh gia sy phu hop thi hanh dong d6 c6 hiéu luc nhu thé né duoc thyc hién
theo quy dinh 66. Tuy nhién, diéu (5) khong ap dung sau khi hét han bat ky
chtng chi nao dugc cap theo thi tuc danh gia sy pht hop hodc sau ngay 31
thang 12 nam 2027.



Stra ¢6i Quy dinh vé San pham Phao hoa (An toan) nim 2015

11. Quy dinh vé San pham Ph4o hoa (An toan) 2015(8) da duoc stra d6i dé bao
gdm diéu khoan chuyén tiép trong quy dinh 74A lién quan dén viéc roi khoi EU.
Ban stra d6i néu rd rang néu mot san pham chua dugc dua ra thi truong trude 11
gid dém ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2024 va nha san xuét da thuc hién bat ky hanh
dong nao theo quy trinh danh gid sy phu hop thi hanh dong d6 co6 hi¢u lyc nhu
thé nd duoc thuc hién theo quy dinh 40. Tuy nhién, diéu (5) khong ap dung sau
khi hét han bat ky chimg chi nao duoc cip theo thil tuc danh gia su phu hop
hoac sau ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2027.

Stra d6i Quy dinh twong thich dién tir 2016

12. Quy dinh twong thich dién tir 2016(9) d3 duoc sira d6i dé bao gom diéu
khoan chuyén tiép trong quy dinh 74A lién quan dén viéc roi khoi EU. Ban sta
ddi néu rd rr?lng néu mét san phém chua duogc dua ra thi truong hoac dua vao su
dung trude 11 gio dém ngay 31 thang 12 nim 2024 va nha san xuat da thuc hién
bat ky hanh dong nao theo quy trinh danh gia su pht hop thi hanh dong d6 co
hiéu luc nhu thé né da duoc thuc hién theo quy dinh. 40. Tuy nhién, diéu (5)
khong 4p dung sau khi bat ky chimg chi nao dugc cép theo thu tuc danh gia su
pht hop hodc sau ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2027 hét han.

Stra d6i Quy dinh vé Binh chiu 4p luc (An toan) don gian nam 2016

13. Quy dinh (An toan) Binh chiu ap luc don gian 2016(10) da dugc stra d6i dé
bao gdm diéu khoan chuyén tiép trong quy dinh 76A lién quan dén viéc roi khoi
EU. Ban stra doi néu rd rang néu mot san pham chua duoc dua ra thi truong
trude 11 gid dém ngay 31 thang 12 nim 2024 va nha san xuat da thuc hién bat
ky hanh dong nao theo quy trinh danh gia sy phu hop thi hanh dong doé s€ co tac
dung tuong tu nhu khi né dugc thuc hién theo quy dinh 40 hodac 41 Tuy nhién,
diéu (5) khong ap dung sau khi hét han bat ky gidy chimg nhan nao duogc cap
theo thu tuc hodc sau ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2027.

Stra d6i Quy dinh Thang may 2016

14. Quy dinh vé thang may 2016(11) da duoc stra doi dé bao gdém céac diéu
khoan chuyén tiép trong quy dinh 82. Cac stra d6i bao gom thay thé "Trong diéu
(4), (5) va (6)" bang "Trong diéu (4) dén (8) ". Ban sira doi ciing néu rd rang néu
mot san pham chua duoc dua ra thi truong trude 11 gio dém ngay 31 thang 12
nam 2024 va nguoi lép dit hodc nha san xuat d thuc hién bat ky hanh dong nao
theo quy trinh danh gia sy phu hop thi hanh dong d6 s& ¢ hiéu lyc nhu thé né
dugc thuc hién theo quy dinh 47 hodc 48. Ban stra doi cling loai bd diéu (7) sau
khi bat ky chimg chi nao duogc cdp theo tha tuc danh gia sy phu hop hét han
hodc sau ngay 31 thang 12 ndm 2027.

Stra d6i Quy dinh vé Thiét bi Ap luc (An toan) 2016

15. Quy dinh vé Thiét bi ap suit (An toan) 2016(12) di dugc sira doi dé bao



gdm viéc thay thé "binh chira" bang "thiét bi 4p suat hodc cum lap rap can thiét,
theo quy dinh 6 hodc 7, dé dap Gmg cac yéu cau an toan thiét yéu duoc néu trong
Phu luc 2". Quy dinh ciling néu ro ré'lng néu mot san phém chua duoc dua ra thi
truong hodc dua vao st dung trude 11 gio dém ngay 31 thang 12 ndm 2024 va
nha san xuat da thuc hién bat ky hanh dong nao theo quy trinh danh gia sy phu
hop theo Piéu 14, diéu (5) s& khong ap dung. Ban stra ddi ciing loai bo diéu (5)
sau khi bat ky chtng chi nao duoc cip theo thu tuc danh gia su phi hop hét han
hodc sau ngay 31 thang 12 ndm 2027.

Stra ddi thiét bi va hé théng bao v¢ du dinh sur dung trong cac quy dinh vé khi
quyén c6 kha ning phat né nim 2016

16. Thiét bi va Hé théng Bao vé Du dinh Sir dung trong Quy dinh vé Khi quyén
C6 Kha nang Phat n6 2016(13) da dugc sta ddi. Trong quy dinh 72A, diéu
khoan chuyén tiép lién quan dén viéc roi khoi EU duoc stra d6i dé bao gdm mot
diéu kién ap dung néu san phém chua dugc dua ra thi truong hodc dua vao su
dung trude 11 gid tdi ngdy 31 thang 12 ndm 2024 va néu nha san xuat da thuc
hién bt ky hanh dong nao theo quy trinh danh gia sy phu hop theo Piéu 13 cia
Chi thi ATEX. Diéu kién nay khong ap dung sau khi hét han bét ky gidy ching
nhan nao duoc cip theo thi tuc hodc sau ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2027.

Stra d6i Quy dinh vé Can khong ty dong nam 2016

17. Quy dinh vé thiét bi can khong ty dong 2016(14) da duoc stra d6i dé bao
gdém diéu khoan chuyén tiép vé viéc roi khoi EU. Ban stra ddi néu rd rang néu
thiét bi can khong ty dong chua dugc dua ra thi truong hoac dua vao st dung
trude ngdy 31 thang 12 ndm 2024 va nha san xuét da thuc hién bat ky hanh dong
nao theo quy trinh danh gia su phu hop thi hanh dong d6 sé c6 hiéu luc nhu thé
né da duoc thyc hién theo quy dinh 36. Tuy nhién, diéu (8) khong ap dung sau
khi bat ky chimg chi ndo dugc cap theo thu tuc danh gia su phu hop hodc sau
ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2027 hét han.

Stra doi Quy dinh vé Dung cu Bo nam 2016

18. Quy dinh vé& dung cu do ludng 2016(15) da dugc stra d6i dé bao gdm diéu
khoan chuyén tiép vé viéc Vuong qudc Anh rat khoi EU. Ban stra doi néu 1
rang néu mot dung cu do theo quy dinh chua dugc dua ra thi truong trude ngay
31 thang 12 nam 2024 va nha san xuat da thyuc hién bat ky hanh dong nao theo
quy trinh danh gia sy phu hop thi hanh dong d6 s€ c6 tac dung tuong tu nhu khi
n6 dugc thyc hién theo quy dinh 39 (1). Tuy nhién, diéu (8) khong ap dung sau
khi hét han bat ky chimg chi nao duoc cip theo thil tuc danh gid su phu hop
hodc sau ngay 31 thang 12 ndm 2027.

Stra d6i Quy dinh Thii cong Giai tri 2017

19. Quy dinh vé thu cong giai tri 2017(16) da duogc sira doi dé bao gom cac diéu
khoan chuyén tiép lién quan dén viéc roi khoi EU. Cac stra d6i bao gdbm mot



diéu moi (8) trong quy dinh 89A, trong d6 néu rd rang néu mot san pham chua
dugc dua ra thi truong trude 11 gio dém ngay 31 thang 12 ndm 2024 va nha san
xudt da thuc hién bat ky hanh dong nao theo quy trinh dugc dé cap trong quy
dinh 42 hoac 43, hanh dong dé co6 hi¢u luc nhu thé n6 duoc thuc hién theo thu
tuc 4p dung dugc dé cap trong quy dinh 42 hodc 43. Ban stra ddi ciing loai bo
cac diéu (6) va (7) sau khi hét hiéu luc cua bat ky ching chi nao duoc cap theo
thu tuc &p dung hodc sau ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2027.
Stra ¢6i Quy dinh vé Thiét bi V6 tuyén 2017
20. Quy dinh vé thiét bi vo tuyén 2017(17) da duoc stra d6i dé bao gdm diéu
khoan chuyén tiép trong quy dinh 76A, trong d6 néu rd rang néu mot san pham
chua duoc dua ra thi truong hodc dua vao s dung trude 11 gio tdi ngay 31
thang 12 ndm 2024 va nha san xuét da thuc hién bat ky hanh dong nao theo quy
trinh danh gia sy phu hop theo Piéu 17 cua Chi thi, diéu (5) s& duoc ap dung.
Tuy nhién, diéu (5) khong 4p dung sau khi hét han bat ky ching chi nao dugc
cap theo tha tuc danh gia sy phtt hop hodc sau ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2027.
Stra d6i Quy dinh (EU) 2016/425
21. Quy dinh (EU) 2016/425 sira d6i quy dinh vé thiét bi bao ho ca nhan, bai bo
Chi thi 89/686/EC(18) cuia Hoi dong. Ban sira d6i bao gom mot diéu khoan moi
trong Piéu 47 (cac diéu khoan chuyén tiép lién quan dén viéc roi khoi EU) ap
dung cho PPE chua dugc dua ra thi truong trude 23 gio dém ngay 31 thang 12
nam 2024. Hanh dong dugc thuc hién theo quy trinh danh gia sy phu hop sé ap
dung cho PPE nhu thé né da dugc thuc hién theo thu tuc hién hanh. Tuy nhién,
diéu 5 khong ap dung sau khi hét han bat ky chimg chi nao duoc cép theo thi
tuc danh gid su phu hop hodc sau ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2027.
Stra d6i Quy dinh (EU) 2016/426
22. Quy dinh (EU) 2016/426 stra d6i quy dinh vé thiét bi d6t nhién liéu khi va
bai bo Chi thi 2009/142/EC(19). Ban stra doi bao gdm mot diéu khoan méi trong
Diéu 44 (cac diéu khoan chuyén tiép lién quan dén viéc roi khoi EU) ap dung
cho cac thiét bi hodc phu kién chua dugc dua ra thi truong trude 23 gio dém
ngay 31 thang 12 nam 2024. Hanh dong dugc thuc hién theo quy trinh danh gia
su phi hop s& ap dung cho thiét bi hodc phu kién nhu thé nd da dugc thuc hién
theo quy trinh hién hanh. Tuy nhién, diéu 5 khong ap dung sau khi hét han bat
ky gidy chimg nhan nao dugc cip theo thi tuc hodc sau ngay 31 thang 12 nim
2027.
Tén
Thir trudong Qudc hoi
Phong Chién luoc Kinh doanh, Ning luong va Cong nghiép
Ngay



LUU Y GIAI THICH

Cac Quy dinh nay dugc thuc hién dé thuc thi cac quyén han duoc trao theo muc
8(1) ctia Pao luat (Rut tién) Lién minh Chau Au nim 2018 (c.16) nham giai
quyét nhirng that bai cta luat phap EU dugc duy tri trong viéc van hanh hiéu qua
va céc thiéu sot khac (dic biét nhu duoc quy dinh néu trong cac doan (a), (c), (d)
va (g) ctia muc 8(2) cua Pao luat do) phat sinh tir viéc Vuong qudc Anh rat khoi
Lién minh Chau Au.

Quy dinh chi ap dung cho Anh, x&r Wales va Scotland.

Quy dinh 2 kéo dai thoi gian dap img mot s6 nghia vu nhat dinh bang cach tuan
thil cdc nghia vu ctia EU tir 24 thang 1én 4 nam ké tir ngdy hoan thanh quyén s
hitu tri tué d6i v6i mot sd san pham nhu quy dinh trong Phy lyc 1.

Quy dinh 3 kéo dai thoi han ma dau phu hop c6 thé duoc dit trén nhan dan vao
san pham hodc tai liéu di kém san pham, thay vi trén ban than san pham, tir 36
thang dén 7 nam ké tir ngdy hoan thanh s¢ hitu tri tué dbi véi mot sé san pham
nhu quy dinh tai Phy luc 2.

Quy dinh 4 kéo dai thoi han ma thong tin xac dinh nha nhap khéu c6 thé duoc
néu trong tai lidu di kém san pham nhap khau tir 24 thang dén 7 nam ké tir ngay
hoan thanh diang ky s& hitu tri tué doi v6i mot sé san pham nhu quy dinh trong
Phu lyc 3.

Céc quy dinh 5 va 6, 8 dén 14 va 15(2)(b) dén 22 quy dinh rang khi nha san xuét
thuc hién hanh dong theo quy trinh danh gid su phu hop cua EU truée ngay 31
thang 12 nam 2024, hanh dong d6 s€ dugc xur ly nhu thé duoc thuc hién theo
quy trinh danh gia sy phit hop ap dung & Anh. Piéu khoan niy bao gdom céc diéu
kién lién quan dén hiéu lyuc lién tuc cta cic chimg chi dugc cip theo quy trinh
danh gia sy phu hop ciia EU va thoi han cubi cing 13 ngay 31 thang 12 nim
2027, sau ngay do diéu khoan s& hét hiéu luc.

Quy dinh 7, lién quan dén my pham, kéo dai thoi han ma yéu cau néu théng tin
xéac dinh nguoi chiu trach nhiém trong tai liéu di kém véi san phdm my pham
nhap khau dugc coi 1a dap ung néu tai liéu cung cip thong tin xac dinh nguoi
chiu trach nhiém cua EU tir 24 thang dén 7 thang nam ké tir ngay hoan thanh
dang ky s& hiru tri tug.

Quy dinh 15(2)(a) khiac phuc mot thiéu st nho.

Ban ghi nhé giai thich dwoc xuadt ban cung véi cic Quy dinh nay trén
www.legislation.gov.uk.

Dénh gia tac dong dﬁy du chua duoc thuq hién cho cong cu nay vi du doan
khong c6 hoac khdong cé tac dong dang ké nao doi véi khu vuc tu nhan, tinh
nguyén hodc cong cong




Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No. 1393

EXITING THE EUROPEAN UNION
CONSUMER PROTECTION
ELECTROMAGNETIC COMPATIBILITY
ENERGY CONSERVATION
ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
HEALTH AND SAFETY
TELECOMMUNICATIONS
WEIGHTS AND MEASURES

The Product Safety and Metrology (Amendment
and Transitional Provisions) Regulations 2022

Made - - - - 21st December 2022
Coming into force - - 31st December 2022

The Secretary of State makes these Regulations in exercise of the powers conferred by section 8(1)
of, and paragraph 21 of Schedule 7 to, the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018(1).

A draft of this instrument has been laid before Parliament under paragraph 1(3) of Schedule 7 to that
Act and approved by a resolution of each House.

Citation, commencement and extent

1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Product Safety and Metrology (Amendment and
Transitional Provisions) Regulations 2022 and come into force on 31st December 2022.

(2) These Regulations extend to England and Wales and Scotland.

(1) 2018 c. 16; section 8 was amended by section 27 of the European Union (Withdrawal Agreement) Act 2020 (c. 1); paragraph
21 of Schedule 7 was amended by section 41(4) and paragraph 53(2) of Schedule 5 to that Act.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2018/16
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2020/1

Document Generated: 2022-12-31
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Expiry of provisions relating to obligations which are met by complying with requirements
under European law

2. In the provisions listed in Schedule 1, for “24 months” substitute “four years”.

Extension of period after which transitory labelling provisions cease to have effect

3. In the provisions listed in Schedule 2, for “36 months” substitute “seven years”.

Expiry of provisions relating to information identifying importers

4. In the provisions listed in Schedule 3, for “24 months™ substitute “seven years”.

Amendment of the Noise Emission in the Environment by Equipment for use Outdoors
Regulations 2001

5.—(1) The Noise Emission in the Environment by Equipment for use Outdoors Regulations
2001(2) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 23 (transitional provision relating to EU exit) after paragraph (4) insert—
“(5) Subject to paragraph (6), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) the product has not been placed on the market or put into service; and

(b) a responsible person has taken any action under the conformity assessment
procedure that applies to that product in accordance with Article 14(1) or 14(2)
of the Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 10.

(6) Paragraph (5) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of the Supply of Machinery (Safety) Regulations 2008
6.—(1) The Supply of Machinery (Safety) Regulations 2008(3) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 30 (transitional provisions in relation to EU exit) after paragraph (3) insert—
“(4) Subject to paragraph (5), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) the product has not been placed on the market or put into service; and

(b) a responsible person has taken any action under the conformity assessment
procedure that applies to that product in accordance with Article 12 of the
Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 10, 11 or 12.

(5) Paragraph (4) does not apply—

(2) S.1.2001/1701; they were made under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 (c. 68) and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.I. 2019/696 and S.1. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(3) S.I. 2008/1597; they were made under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved by
virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.1. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

2


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/1701
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1972/68
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/1597
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273

Document Generated: 2022-12-31
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of Regulation (EU) 1223/2009

7. In Article 19 of Regulation (EU) 1223/2009 of the European Parliament and Council on
cosmetic products(4) (labelling) in paragraph (1)(ab) for “two years” substitute “seven years”.

Amendment of the Ecodesign for Energy-Related Products Regulations 2010
8.—(1) The Ecodesign for Energy-Related Products Regulations 2010(5) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 20A (transitional provisions in relation to EU exit) after paragraph (4) insert—
“(4A) Subject to paragraph (4B), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) aproduct has not been placed on the market or put into service; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to that product in accordance with Article 8 of the Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable procedure set out in
Schedule 1A.

(4B) Paragraph (4A) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of the Toys (Safety) Regulations 2011
9.—(1) The Toys (Safety) Regulations 2011(6) are amended as follows.

(2) Inregulation 2A (transitional provisions in relation to EU exit) after paragraph (5) insert—
“(6) Subject to paragraph (7), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) aproduct has not been placed on the market; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to that product in accordance with Article 19 of the Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 13.

(7) Paragraph (6) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

(4) EUR 2009/1223, as amended by S.I. 2019/696; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(5) S.1.2010/2617; they were made under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved by
virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.I. 2019/539; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(6) S.I.2011/1881; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.1. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

3


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/2617
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/539
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/1881
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273

Document Generated: 2022-12-31
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Amendment of the Explosives Regulations 2014
10.—(1) The Explosives Regulations 2014(7) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 82A (transitional provision in relation to EU exit) after paragraph (4) insert—
“(5) Subject to paragraph (6), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) aproduct has not been placed on the market; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to that product in accordance with Article 20 of the Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 66.

(6) Paragraph (5) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of the Pyrotechnic Articles (Safety) Regulations 2015
11.—(1) The Pyrotechnic Articles (Safety) Regulations 2015(8) are amended as follows.

(2) Inregulation 74A (transitional provision in relation to EU exit) after paragraph (4) insert—
“(5) Subject to paragraph (6), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) aproduct has not been placed on the market; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to that product in accordance with Article 17 of the Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 40.

(6) Paragraph (5) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of the Electromagnetic Compatibility Regulations 2016
12.—(1) The Electromagnetic Compatibility Regulations 2016(9) are amended as follows.
(2) Inregulation 74A (transitional provision in relation to EU exit) after paragraph (4) insert—
“(5) Subject to paragraph (6), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) aproduct has not been placed on the market or put into service; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to that product in accordance with Article 14 of the Directive

(7) S.I.2014/1638; they were made in part under the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved by virtue of
section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales and Scotland
by S.I. 2016/315, S.1. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(8) S.I.2015/1553; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.I. 2019/696 and S.1. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(9) S.1.2016/1091; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.1. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

4


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2014/1638
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/315
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/1553
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/1091
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273

Document Generated: 2022-12-31
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 40.

(6) Paragraph (5) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of the Simple Pressure Vessels (Safety) Regulations 2016
13.—(1) The Simple Pressure Vessels (Safety) Regulations 2016(10) are amended as follows.

(2) Inregulation 76A (transitional provision in relation to EU exit) after paragraph (4) insert—
“(5) Subject to paragraph (6), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) aproduct has not been placed on the market; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to that product in accordance with Article 13(1) or 13(2) of the
Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 40 or 41.

(6) Paragraph (5) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of the Lifts Regulations 2016
14.—(1) The Lifts Regulations 2016(11) are amended as follows.

(2) Inregulation 82 (transitional provisions)—
(a) in paragraph (3) for “In paragraphs (4), (5) and (6)” substitute “In paragraphs (4) to (8)”;
(b) after paragraph (6) insert—
“(7) Subject to paragraph (8), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) aproduct has not been placed on the market; and

(b) an installer or a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity
assessment procedure that applies to that product in accordance with Article 15
or 16 of the Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 47 or 48.

(8) Paragraph (7) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

(10) S.I. 2016/1092; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.I. 2019/696 and S.1. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(11) S.I.2016/1093; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.1. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

5


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/1092
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/1093
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273

Document Generated: 2022-12-31
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Amendment of the Pressure Equipment (Safety) Regulations 2016
15.—(1) The Pressure Equipment (Safety) Regulations 2016(12) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 88A (transitional provision in relation to EU Exit)—

(a) in paragraph (1) for “a vessel” substitute “pressure equipment or an assembly required,
under regulation 6 or 7, to satisfy the essential safety requirements set out in Schedule 2”;

(b) after paragraph (4) insert—
“(5) Subject to paragraph (6), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) aproduct has not been placed on the market or put into service; and

(b) amanufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to that product in accordance with Article 14 of the Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 41 or 42.

(6) Paragraph (5) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of the Equipment and Protective Systems Intended for Use in Potentially
Explosive Atmospheres Regulations 2016

16.—(1) The Equipment and Protective Systems Intended for Use in Potentially Explosive
Atmospheres Regulations 2016(13) are amended as follows.

(2) Inregulation 72A (transitional provision in relation to EU Exit) after paragraph (4) insert—
“(5) Subject to paragraph (6), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) aproduct has not been placed on the market or put into service; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to that product in accordance with Article 13 of the ATEX Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 39.

(6) Paragraph (5) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of the Non-automatic Weighing Instruments Regulations 2016

17.—(1) The Non-automatic Weighing Instruments Regulations 2016(14) are amended as
follows.

(12) S.I.2016/1105; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.1. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(13) S.1. 2016/1107; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.I. 2019/696 and S.1. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(14) S.I.2016/1152; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.1. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

6


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/1105
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/1107
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/1152
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273

Document Generated: 2022-12-31
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(2) Inregulation 4A (transitional provision in relation to EU exit) after paragraph (7) insert—
“(8) Subject to paragraph (9), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—

(a) a non-automatic weighing instrument has not been placed on the market or put
into service; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to that product in accordance with Article 13 of the Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 36.

(9) Paragraph (8) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of the Measuring Instruments Regulations 2016

18.—(1) The Measuring Instruments Regulations 2016(15) are amended as follows.

(2) In paragraph 2A of Schedule 3 (transitional provisions relating to UK withdrawal from the
EU) after paragraph (7) insert—

“(8) Subject to paragraph (9), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) aregulated measuring instrument has not been placed on the market; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to that product in accordance with Article 17 of the Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 39(1).

(9) Paragraph (8) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of the Recreational Craft Regulations 2017
19.—(1) The Recreational Craft Regulations 2017(16) are amended as follows.

(2) Inregulation 89A (transitional provisions in relation to EU exit) after paragraph (5) insert—
“(6) Subject to paragraph (8), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) aproduct has not been placed on the market; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the procedure that applies to that
product in accordance with Articles 19 to 24 of the Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable procedure referred to in
regulation 42 or 43.

(7) Subject to paragraph (8), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—

(15) S.I. 2016/1153; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.I. 2019/696 and S.1. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(16) S.I. 2017/737; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.1. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

7


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/1153
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/737
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273

Document Generated: 2022-12-31
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(a) aproduct has not been placed on the market or put into service; and

(b) a private importer or a person to whom regulation 43(2) applies has taken any
action under the procedure that applies to that product in accordance with Article
23 of the Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable procedure referred to in
regulation 43.

(8) Paragraphs (6) and (7) do not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of the Radio Equipment Regulations 2017
20.—(1) The Radio Equipment Regulations 2017(17) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 76A (transitional provision in relation to EU exit) after paragraph (4) insert—
“(5) Subject to paragraph (6), where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) aproduct has not been placed on the market or put into service; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to that product in accordance with Article 17 of the Directive

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in regulation 41.

(6) Paragraph (5) does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of Regulation (EU) 2016/425

21.—(1) Regulation (EU) 2016/425 of the European Parliament and of the Council on personal
protective equipment and repealing Council Directive 89/686/EC(18) is amended as follows.

(2) In Article 47 (transitional provisions in relation to EU exit) after paragraph 4 insert—

“5. Subject to paragraph 6, where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) PPE has not been placed on the market; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to the PPE in accordance with Article 19 of Regulation 2016/425
(pre-exit)

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in Article 19 of this Regulation.

6. Paragraph 5 does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(17) S.I.2017/1206; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.1. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(18) EUR 2016/425, as amended by S.I. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

8


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/european/directive/1989/0686
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/1206
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273

Document Generated: 2022-12-31
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Amendment of Regulation (EU) 2016/426

22.—(1) Regulation (EU) 2016/426 of the European Parliament and Council on appliances
burning gaseous fuels and repealing Directive 2009/142/EC(19) is amended as follows.

(2) In Article 44 (transitional provisions in relation to EU exit) after paragraph 4 insert—

“5. Subject to paragraph 6, where before 11pm on 31st December 2024—
(a) an appliance or fitting has not been placed on the market; and

(b) a manufacturer has taken any action under the conformity assessment procedure
that applies to that appliance or fitting in accordance with Article 14 of Regulation
2016/426 (pre-exit)

that action has effect as if it had been done under the applicable conformity assessment
procedure referred to in Article 14 of this Regulation.

6. Paragraph 5 does not apply—

(a) after the expiry of the validity of any certificate issued pursuant to the applicable
conformity assessment procedure; and

(b) in any event, after 31st December 2027.”.

Kevin Hollinrake

Parliamentary Under Secretary of State

Department for Business, Energy and Industrial

21st December 2022 Strategy

(19) EUR 2016/429, as amended by S.I. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.
9


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/european/directive/2009/0142
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273

Document Generated: 2022-12-31
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE 1 Regulation 2

The provisions referred to in regulation 2 are as follows—

(a) regulation 7B(1) of the Measuring Container Bottles (EEC Requirements) Regulations
1977(20);

(b) regulation 12B(1) of the Noise Emission in the Environment by Equipment for use
Outdoors Regulations 2001;

(c) regulation 12B(1) of the Supply of Machinery (Safety) Regulations 2008;

(d) regulation SA(3)(aa) of the Aerosol Dispensers Regulations 2009(21);

(e) regulation 20C(1) of the Ecodesign for Energy-Related Products Regulations 2010;
(f) regulation 39AA(1) of the Toys (Safety) Regulations 2011;

(g) regulation 34B(1) of the Restriction of the Use of Certain Hazardous Substances in
Electrical and Electronic Equipment Regulations 2012(22);

(h) regulation 64C(1) and (3) of the Explosives Regulations 2014;
(1) regulation 38E(1) and (3) of the Pyrotechnic Articles (Safety) Regulations 2015;
(j) regulation 38B(1) of the Electromagnetic Compatibility Regulations 2016;

(k) regulation 38C(1) and (3) of the Simple Pressure Vessels (Safety) Regulations 2016;
(1) regulation 45C(1) and (3) of the Lifts Regulations 2016;

(m) regulation 34B(1) of the Electrical Equipment (Safety) Regulations 2016;

(n) regulation 39C(1) and (3) of the Pressure Equipment (Safety) Regulations 2016;

(o) regulation 36C(1) and (3) of the Equipment and Protective Systems Intended for Use in
Potentially Explosive Atmospheres Regulations 2016;

(p) regulation 32C(1) and (3) of the Non-automatic Weighing Instruments Regulations 2016;
(q) regulation 33C(1) and (3) of the Measuring Instruments Regulations 2016;

(r) regulation 40C(1) and (3) of the Recreational Craft Regulations 2017,

(s) regulation 36B(1) of the Radio Equipment Regulations 2017;

(t) regulation 2C(1) and (3) of the Personal Protective Equipment (Enforcement) Regulations
2018(23);

(u) regulation 2C(1) and (3) of Gas Appliances (Enforcement) and Miscellaneous
Amendments Regulations 2018(24).

(20) S.I. 1977/932; they were made under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved by virtue
of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales and
Scotland by S.I. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(21) S.I. 2009/2824; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.I. 2019/696 and S.1. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(22) S.1.2012/3032; they were made under the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved by virtue of section 2(1)
of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales and Scotland by S.1.
2019/188, S.1. 2020/1647 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(23) S.1. 2018/390; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.I. 2019/696 and S.1. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

(24) S.I. 2018/389; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.1. 2019/696 and S.I. 2021/1273; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

10


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1977/932
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2009/2824
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/3032
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/188
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/188
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1647
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2018/390
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2018/389
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/1273

Document Generated: 2022-12-31
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE 2 Regulation 3

The provisions referred to in regulation 3 are as follows—

(a) regulation 5(2A) of the Measuring Container Bottles (EEC Requirements) Regulations
1977,

(b) regulation 7(2B) of the Noise Emission in the Environment by Equipment for use Outdoors
Regulations 2001;

(c) regulation 7(2A) of the Supply of Machinery (Safety) Regulations 2008;
(d) regulation 3(1A) of the Aerosol Dispensers Regulations 2009;
(e) regulation 18(3A) of the Toys (Safety) Regulations 2011;

(f) regulation 16(2A) of the Restriction of the Use of Certain Hazardous Substances in
Electrical and Electronic Equipment Regulations 2012;

(g) regulation 68(1A) of the Explosives Regulations 2014;
(h) regulation 42(1A) of the Pyrotechnic Articles (Safety) Regulations 2015;
(1) regulation 42(1A) of the Electromagnetic Compatibility Regulations 2016;
(j) regulation 6(1A) of the Simple Pressure Vessels (Safety) Regulations 2016;
(k) regulation 50(1A) of the Lifts Regulations 2016;
() regulation 39(1A) of the Electrical Equipment (Safety) Regulations 2016;
(m) regulation 49(1A) of the Pressure Equipment (Safety) Regulations 2016;

(n) regulation41(1A) ofthe Equipment and Protective Systems Intended for Use in Potentially
Explosive Atmospheres Regulations 2016;

(o) regulation 6(2) of the Non-automatic Weighing Instruments Regulations 2016;
(p) regulation 7(2) of the Measuring Instruments Regulations 2016;

(q) regulation 54(1A) of the Recreational Craft Regulations 2017;

(r) regulation 44(1A) and (2A) of the Radio Equipment Regulations 2017;

(s) Article 17(1A) of Regulation (EU) 2016/425 of the European Parliament and of the
Council on personal protective equipment and repealing Council Directive 89/686/EEC;

(t) Article 17(1A) of Regulation (EU) 2016/426 of the European Parliament and of the
Council on appliances burning gaseous fuels and repealing Directive 2009/142/EC.

SCHEDULE 3 Regulation 4

The provisions referred to in regulation 4 are as follows—
(a) regulation 3(7) of the Weights and Measures (Packaged Goods) Regulations 2006(25);
(b) regulation 31(2)(b) of the Supply of Machinery (Safety) Regulations 2008;
(c) regulation 27(2)(a)(iii) of the Toys (Safety) Regulations 2011;

(d) regulation 24(2)(a)(ii) of the Restriction of the Use of Certain Hazardous Substances in
Electrical and Electronic Equipment Regulations 2012;

(e) regulation 50(1A) of the Explosives Regulations 2014;

(25) S.I. 2006/659; they were made in part under section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972 and are accordingly saved
by virtue of section 2(1) of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018; they were amended in respect of England and Wales
and Scotland by S.1. 2019/696 and S.I. 2020/1460; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

11


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/european/directive/1989/0686
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/european/directive/2009/0142
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/659
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/696
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1460

Document Generated: 2022-12-31
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(f) regulation 17(3)(a)(ii) of the Pyrotechnic Articles (Safety) Regulations 2015;

(g) regulation 20(1A)(a)(ii) of the Electromagnetic Compatibility Regulations 2016;
(h) regulation 21(1A)(a)(ii) of the Simple Pressure Vessels (Safety) Regulations 2016;
(1) regulation 28(3)(a)(ii) of the Lifts Regulations 2016;

(j) regulation18(3)(a)(ii) of the Electrical Equipment (Safety) Regulations 2016;

(k) regulation 23(3)(a)(ii) of the Pressure Equipment (Safety) Regulations 2016;

(1) regulation 21(3)(a)(ii) of the Equipment and Protective Systems Intended for Use in
Potentially Explosive Atmospheres Regulations 2016;

(m) regulation 18(2)(a)(ii) of the Non-automatic Weighing Instruments Regulations 2016;
(n) regulation 19(2)(a)(ii) of the Measuring Instruments Regulations 2016;

(o) regulation 21(2)(a)(ii) of the Recreational Craft Regulations 2017;

(p) regulation 23(3)(a)(ii) of the Radio Equipment Regulations 2017;

(q) Article 10(3)(a)(ii) of Regulation (EU) 2016/425 of the European Parliament and of the
Council on personal protective equipment and repealing Council Directive 89/686/EC;

(r) Article 9(3)(a)(ii) of Regulation (EU) 2016/426 of the European Parliament and Council
on appliances burning gaseous fuels and repealing Directive 2009/142/EC.

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations are made in exercise of the powers conferred by section 8(1) of the European
Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018 (c. 16) in order to address failures of retained EU law to operate
effectively and other deficiencies (in particular as set out in paragraphs (a), (c), (d) and (g) of
section 8(2) of that Act) arising from the withdrawal of the United Kingdom from the European
Union.

The Regulations extend to England and Wales and Scotland only.

Regulation 2 extends the period during which certain obligations are met by complying with EU
obligations from 24 months to four years from IP completion day for a number of products as set
out in Schedule 1.

Regulation 3 extends the period during which conformity markings can be placed on a label affixed
to the product, or a document accompanying the product, rather than on the product itself, from 36
months to seven years from IP completion day for a number of products as set out in Schedule 2.

Regulation 4 extends the period during which information identifying an importer can be set out in
a document accompanying the imported product from 24 months to seven years from IP completion
day for a number of products as set out in Schedule 3.

Regulations 5 and 6, 8 to 14 and 15(2)(b) to 22 provide that where a manufacturer has taken
action under EU conformity assessment procedures before 31st December 2024, that action will be
treated as if taken under the conformity assessment procedures which apply in Great Britain. The
provision includes conditions relating to the continued validity of certificates issued in respect of

12


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/european/directive/1989/0686
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/european/directive/2009/0142
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2018/16

Document Generated: 2022-12-31
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

the EU conformity assessment procedures and a cut-off date of 31st December 2027, after which
the provision will cease to have effect.

Regulation 7, in relation to cosmetics, extends the period during which the requirement to set out
information identifying a responsible person in a document accompanying an imported cosmetic
product is treated as met if the document provides information identifying an EU responsible person
from 24 months to seven years from IP completion day.

Regulation 15(2)(a) corrects a minor miscellaneous deficiency.
An Explanatory Memorandum is published alongside these Regulations on www.legislation.gov.uk.

A full impact assessment has not been produced for this instrument as no, or no significant, impact
on the private, voluntary or public sector is foreseen.

13


http://www.legislation.gov.uk

